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Brief Textbook of Surgery. Curtis 
P. Artz, Isidore Cohn, John H. 
Davis, W.B. Saunders, Philadel­
phia, 1976, 694 pp„ $17.50.

If the family physician is not in­
terested in performing major 
surgery this is an excellent book for 
him/her to have in the library as a 
quick reference text. It very care­
fully omits both major and minor 
surgical techniques and deals 
primarily with surgical diagnosis,

and pre-operative and post­
operative care. Chapters are de­
voted to wound healing, fluid and 
electrolyte balance, and surgical in­
fection.

Especially useful to the family 
physician are those chapters which 
relate to the emergency care of 
trauma—the acutely injured pa­
tient; shock and hemorrhage; frac­
tures, dislocations, and sprains; 
and thermal, chemical, and electri­
cal injuries.

The remaining chapters address 
themselves to the individual organ 
systems and, as stated earlier, deal 
with surgical diagnosis plus pre and 
post-operative care.

The prime virtue of this textbook 
is that it fulfills its intention by 
providing basic information for the 
undergraduate medical student and 
for the nonsurgical clinician. In 
many instances, the discussion 
seems rather shallow; still, it ade­
quately treats indications for surgery 
while avoiding detail unimportant 
to one not performing the actual 
surgery.

In summary this publication 
concerns itself with surgical diag­
nosis, pre and post-operative care,

Continued on next page
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and the emergency care of the in­
jured patient. It does so, in most 
instances, in a more practical fash­
ion than most surgery texts that 
deal primarily with techniques.

George E. Burket, Jr, MD 
University o f Kansas 

Medical Center 
Kansas City, Kansas

Costs, Risks, and Benefits of 
Surgery. Edited by John P. Bunker, 
Benjamin A. Barnes and Frederick 
Mosteller. Oxford University 
Press, New York, 1977, 401 pp., 
$22.50.

Costs, Risks, and Benefits o f 
Surgery is the result of two years’ 
work by various members of an In­
terdisciplinary Seminar in Health 
and Medicine at Harvard Univer­
sity in 1972. It represents the first 
comprehensive treatment of 
surgery from the perspectives in 
the title.

The basic goal of this book, as 
stated in the preface, is to attempt 
to answer the question, “ How can 
we get the most from resources we 
allocate to medical care?” As such 
it is directed to the physician and 
the patient who are contemplating 
surgery, as well as to the 
decision-makers in society who are 
considering questions regarding re­
source allocation and the setting of 
priorities. The book also attempts 
to facilitate surgical decision­
making on the basis of logic instead 
of dogma. On the whole, the 34 
contributors have produced an ex­
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cellent reference work which 
achieves its goals well. Its strength 
lies in the deliberate selection for 
study of examples of surgical pro­
cedures about which there is uncer­
tainty and disagreement within the 
medical profession. These are ex­
amined using the methods of cost- 
benefit analysis, decision analysis, 
statistical analysis, and economic 
theory.

Some of the areas examined in 
detail include: elective inguinal 
herniorrhaphy vs truss in the el­
derly, cholecystectomy for silent 
gallstones, elective hysterectomy, 
breast cancer, and coronary artery 
surgery.

Sections of the book are quite 
technical and somewhat difficult to 
digest. However, as a reference 
work it would be appropriate for 
surgeons, health resource planners, 
and medical educators in family 
practice and surgical specialties.

P. G. Hodgetts, MD 
Toronto General Hospital 

Toronto, Ontario

An Introduction to Electrocardiog­
raphy (5th Edition). Leo Scham- 
roth. Blackwell Scientific Publica­
tions, Oxford University Press and 
available from JB Lippincott Com­
pany, Philadelphia, 1976, 240 pp., 
$ 1 0 .0 0 .

This is the fifth edition of an in­
troductory treatise on electrocar­
diography which enjoys worldwide 
popularity. It is directed primarily 
to the beginner and thus, simplicity 
and conciseness were major objec­
tives in its preparation. I found its 
240 pages to contain highly under­
standable and quite complete pre-

Continued on page 244
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sentation of the most important as­
pects of the basic principles of elec­
trocardiography as well as the vari­
ous electrocardiographic abnor­
malities. The information is cur­
rent, as new sections on the 
hyperacute phase of myocardial in­
farction, variant forms of angina 
pectoris, and the hem block con­
cept have been added. Illustrations 
are extensive and clear and are a 
major asset. The book is the most 
readable of any of the introductory 
approaches to this field that I have 
read, and yet contains sufficient in­
formation on the entire subject to 
make it useful for frequent refer­
ence. The section on disorders of 
cardiac rhythm is especially good. 
Medical students, family practice 
residents, and practicing family 
physicians should all be well served 
by this beautifully written little 
book. Its ten-dollar cost is to me 
the best possible investment for 
useful information in this field.

Herbert R. Brettell, MD 
Denver, Colorado

Early Care of the Injured Patient 
(2nd Edition). The Committee on 
Trauma, American College o f Sur­
geons. W. B. Saunders Company, 
Philadelphia, 1976, 443 pp., $12.50.

When the first edition of Early 
Care o f the Injured Patient was in­
itially published, there had been a 
need for a text that gave specific 
but not exhaustive information on 
the assessment and management of

the traumatized patient. The sec­
ond edition of this text retains the 
timeliness and usefulness of the 
first edition with the valuable addi­
tion of considerable updating in 
respiratory care, resuscitation, 
renal failure, and venous repair, to 
mention a few, as well as com­
pletely new sections on legal ad­
vice, informed consent, and mass 
casualty treatment. The book’s 
orientation is primarily toward 
physicians working in Emergency 
Departments, but contains valuable 
information on the primary as­
sessment and management of an in­
jured patient, including treatment 
for shock, and the initial stabiliza­
tion and treatment of simple frac­
tures.

The organization of this book 
makes it eminently satisfactory as a 
rapid reference text. It begins with 
the most seriously injured patient 
and gives valuable information in 
chapters on cardiopulmonary re­
suscitation, shock and fluid re­
placement, infection, and anes­
thesia. There are also chapters on 
initial care of bums and chemical, 
electrical, and cold injuries, as well 
as bites and stings. Subsequent 
chapters deal in a systematic way 
with the general areas of the body 
that might be involved in a trauma­
tic injury. Three chapters are de­
voted to the management of frac­
tures. There is a general chapter on 
fracture treatment, followed by one 
on fractures in adults and one on 
children’s fractures. All of these 
are accompanied by line drawings 
which illustrate the principles de­
lineated. Chapters on head trauma 
and spinal cord injuries are particu­
larly designed to answer specific 
questions regarding management of 
the patient and are accompanied by 
sufficient illustration. In the case of

Continued on page 248
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head injuries, a flow sheet is in­
cluded which would be useful for 
the recording of continuous 
monitoring of the patient who has 
such an injury.

Early Care of the Injured Patient 
will serve admirably for a mature 
family physician who, when con­
fronted with specific problems, 
desires to have a text to consult for 
rapid review and an update on cur­
rent management. The book does 
suffer from a lack of a bibliography 
and extensive discussion, particu­
larly in the treatment area; answers 
to questions in those areas must be 
sought elsewhere. For the student 
physician and nurse practitioner, 
the text likewise can be useful as a 
rapid reminder or reference source 
to check the method of treatment to 
be used, particularly on the subject 
of fractures, since it gives valuable 
data on diagnosis and treatment of 
all the major dislocations and frac­
tures. The chapter on the neck, the 
description of the emergency 
cricothyroidotomy and elective 
tracheostomy are presented in such 
a way as to be of value to any indi­
vidual finding him/herself in an 
emergency situation and wanting a 
quick review of the procedure.

This 443-page book is a valuable 
addition to the reference library in 
any Emergency Department and 
should be owned by any physician 
who initially cares for patients fol­
lowing injury. It can well serve as 
an additional review book for the 
library of the medical student or 
family nurse practitioner who is to 
be involved with the early care of 
patients who have been 
traumatized.

Richard C. Barnett, MD 
Community Hospital o f Sonoma

County
Santa Rosa, California

Medical Malpractice— The Dul# 
Law Journal Symposium. Duke Law 
Journal. Ballinger Publishing Com­
pany, Cambridge, Massachusem 
1977, 304 pp., $15.00.

E ven  th o se  fam ily  physicians 
having more than average interestini 
the m alpractice litigation problem 
may find this book so exhaustive as 
to  be ex h a u stin g . It consists oi 
com prehensive essays written from 
the legal standpoint and apparently 
without regard for their ultimate in­
clusion in a single publication. Asa 
result, there is a great deal of dupli­
cation o f  background material, def­
in itions, and history; as much ass 
fourth o f  som e o f  the essays consist! 
o f such reiteration.

Another problem  is the format,in 
which footnotes frequently occupy 
more o f  the page than the text, mat 
ing reading slow  and laborious.

Fam ily physicians will find littlt 
of practical value here, except foil 
those w ho are intim ately involvedir, 
organizational activity pertaining toy 
m alpractice insurance and legist 
tion. The problem s faced by the 
practitioner— increased premiums, 
th e n eed  to  p r a c tic e  defensive 
m edicine, inequitable premiumsfoi 
part-time practice, etc— are clearly 
defined and d iscussed , but no hint 
are given as to what action the indi­
vidual can take in seeking relief. Al 
o f  the solutions suggested involve 
m a ss iv e  le g is la t iv e  and legal 
change, and this serves to point uf 
the need for active participation by 
m edical organizations in shapiny 
the course o f  change. This bool 
therefore, will be o f  greatest value 
to those in legal, political, and ad 
m inistrative positions.

Continued on next page
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It is perhaps notable that the 
point of view of the medical profes­
sion is nowhere directly expressed. 
There are some quotations and ci­
tations, but none of the contributors 
represent organized medicine nor 
are any contributors practicing 
physicians. In view of the stated aim 
of the editor to bring together in one 
volume “the medical, legal, insur­
ance, and sociological aspects” of 
the problem, it is unclear whether 
this omission is intentional or inad­
vertent.

Collin Baker, MD 
Duke University Medical Center 

Durham, North Carolina

The Common Symptom Guide. John 
Wasson, B. Timothy Walsh, 
Richard Tompkins and Harold Sox, 
Jr. McGraw-Hill, New York, 1975, 
353 pp., $4.25 (paper).

While patients come to the 
physician with symptoms, most 
textbooks of medicine provide de­
tail about disease. Recognizing that 
the student of medicine needs as­
sistance to bridge the gap between 
symptom and disease, the authors 
prepared The Common Symptom 
Guide. This book provides in out­
line format pertinent historical and 
physical findings and also a list of 
diagnostic considerations which 
should be considered for each of 100 

symptoms commonly presented by 
adults and children.

The book begins with an index of 
approximately 400 symptom com­
plexes, identifying for each which of 
the 100 symptoms covered in the 
book will be of assistance. Thus, the 
reader seeking to evaluate a patient 
complaining of “ stiff neck” will be 
directed to outlines in the book deal­
ing with “fever,” “ headache,” and

“ neck pain.” Under each of these 
headings the reader finds relevant 
historical and physical findings 
which will assist him/her in identify­
ing which diagnostic possibilities 
need to be seriously considered. 
Each symptom complex is ad­
dressed first to adults and then to 
children. Information in the 
Guide is drawn from two 
textbooks of internal medicine, two 
of pediatrics, and one each of family 
medicine and surgery. Insofar as 
possible, references are provided to 
specific pages in Harrison’s Princi­
ples o f Internal Medicine. As might 
be expected from the reference 
sources, the symptom of chest pain 
is more comprehensively addressed 
than that of vaginal bleeding.

The authors recognize the risks 
inherent in trying to rigorously fit 
symptom complexes into disease 
categories and caution the reader 
that symptoms presented by the pa­
tient may not always be the underly­
ing problem for which the patient 
seeks assistance.

It is this reviewer’s opinion that 
The Common Symptom Guide may 
be of real assistance to the student 
of medicine for whom it was 
primarily developed. It will be of 
relatively less value to the experi­
enced clinician. The medical stu­
dent or beginning house officer fre­
quently has real difficulty in know­
ing what additional information to 
elicit and which diseases need to be 
considered. It would be of interest 
to assess the impact of this book 
upon the speed whereby clinical 
students develop valuative and 
diagnostic skills.

Jack M. Colwill, MD
University o f Missouri-Columbia

Continued on page 391
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Radiology and Injury in Sport. Jack 
W. Bowerman. Appleton-Cen- 
tury-Crofts, New York, 1977, 334 
pp., $26.50.

The relationship of a particular 
sport activity and injuries peculiar 
to that sport is an important concept 
and relates to problems frequently 
encountered in any busy family 
practice. This small book puts to­
gether this relationship in an inter­
esting fashion and goes a long way 
toward correlating diagnostic think­
ing and radiologic techniques to the 
site of injury and the sport involved.

Bowerman’s book is divided into 
three parts. The first part is a brief 
compilation of descriptions of 
radiologic techniques by site of in­
jury. There are some standard 
views and some unusual views well 
reproduced and normal and ab­
normal radiographs presented.

Part 2 is perhaps the most inter­
esting section, in that a discussion 
of injury and diagnostic radio­
graphs are compiled for some of our 
most popular sports. The “ Little 
League elbow” and professional 
“pitcher’s elbow” are discussed 
and interesting radiographs are in­
cluded. Football injuries, including 
frequency of injury and examples of 
same, are included along with a 
good list of references for further 
study. Soccer, skiing, motorcycle 
riding, lacrosse, and karate are all 
mentioned, though sometimes 
briefly, but references are given for 
further study for each sport.

Part 3 is a somewhat brief compi­
lation of teaching radiographs 
which are well reproduced and 
which are presented as examples of 
how the diagnosis of an injury may 
be demonstrated by radiographic 
means. Some radiographs are pre­
sented twice for self-instruction so 
that areas of injury can be studied in

an unmarked radiograph while the 
learner covers the explanatory 
radiograph.

Radiology and Injury in Sport is a 
useful book for family practice resi­
dents as well as family physicians 
who are seeing patients injured from 
sporting accidents. This is not a 
comprehensive reference text but 
serves more as a stimulus to under­
standing the mechanism of injury 
and as a resource for further study. 
It, indeed, goes far toward helping 
the physician order, use, and in­
terpret appropriate radiographs for 
suspected injury from a given sport.

Douglas O. Corpron, MD 
Family Medicine-Yakima Valley 

Washington

Team Care in General Prac­
tice. Geoffrey Marsh and Peter 
Kain-Caudle. Croom Helm, Lon­
don, 1976, 185 pp., (available only 
in U.K., £7).

Team Care in General Practice 
is a major work in the study of 
health services delivery in primary 
care. As such, the book is of wide 
general interest to family physi­
cians, both in teaching and in prac­
tice, and to others interested in the 
study of health services. The book 
reports a small, concise, and ex­
tremely well-designed and well- 
managed study. Even though the 
study is small and limited to one 
unusual practice in England, the is­
sues researched are large and 
complex and contain broad impli­
cations. The book represents a 
landmark in showing the way a 
small practice can be used to re­
search some of the critical ques­
tions in primary care. As an exam­
ple of individual as opposed to in-

Continued on next page
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stitutional research in health-care 
delivery, this book contains many 
lessons for primary care physi­
cians.

The first three chapters in the 
book form an excellent review of 
general practice health services de­
livery in England, of the workload 
of physicians throughout the 
United Kingdom, and of the pri­
mary care team. There are exten­
sive bibliographies at the end of 
each of these three chapters.

The third chapter reviews the 
British concept of the primary 
health-care team which is similar to 
the American concept with three 
exceptions: (1) the role of health 
visitors, (2) the role of midwives, 
and (3) the role of social work­
ers. The health visitor (usually 
an RN) is basically a health edu- 
cator/patient advocate who is in­
volved particularly in perinatal 
care. The midwife role is well es­
tablished in Britain but not well es­
tablished in mainstream health care 
in America. An unusual aspect is 
the reluctance of social workers to 
join into the primary health-care 
team in England. They work out of 
agencies and are not generally 
members of the primary care team.

The fourth chapter reviews the 
particular practice itself as well as 
the design of the study. The prac­
tice is clinically organized around 
the physician, who is a member of a 
five-physician center. This physi­
cian (G. Marsh) studied his practice 
for one year (1972) after organizing 
it in a nontraditional way, ie, as a 
team. The book then reviews the 
methods used by the team and, in 
general, they are similar to meth­
ods used in the United States. 
There is a daily 15-minute morning 
meeting to coordinate patient care. 
The nurse spends a great deal of

time making home visits and also 
deals through the physician in clin­
ical decision-making. The personal 
physician is an important concept 
throughout this book as evidenced 
by the high (85 percent) degree of 
continuity of that practice popula­
tion with this one physician (as op­
posed to others in his medical 
center).

Chapters 5 and 6 explain and 
clarify the data in some detail. The 
overall conclusion is that a low 
workload is demonstrated for the 
physician, and hospital referral is 
also reduced. One of the lowest re­
ported patient visit rates in the 
United Kingdom was noted for this 
practice, 2.3 visits per patient per 
year. The hospital referral rate was 
38 percent of the national average.

Part two reviews patient satis­
faction; this study was done by an 
independent sociology team using a 
personal interview system. There 
were six hypotheses tested and all 
were proven to be true. The six hy­
potheses were: (1) that the patients 
were satisfied with the overall 
health-care service they received,
(2) that patients were satisfied with 
the care given by the individual 
members of the primary care team,
(3) that patients preferred a per­
sonal doctor service within the set­
ting of the team, (4) that patients 
clearly distinguished between the 
competence of the qualified nurses 
and the receptionist, (5) that pa­
tients who had experienced a serv­
ice would view it more favorably 
than those who were unfamiliar 
with it, and (6) that patient satis­
faction with the overall service and 
its components was unrelated to 
patient age or social class.

In the final chapter, well- 
qualified conclusions were pre­
sented as “findings, not facts.” Dr.

Continued on page 396

Tiissionexi
(resin complexes of 
hydrocodone and 
phenyltoloxamine)

.T he.
antitussive  

th a tg o e s  
further.

Composition: Each capsule, tea­
spoonful (5 ml.) or tablet contains 
5 mg. hydrocodone (Warning: 
may be habit-forming), and lOmg. 
phenyltoloxamine as cationic 
resin complexes.
Effects: An effective antitussive 
which acts for approximately 
12 hours.
Dosage: Adults: 1 teaspoonful 
(5 ml.), capsule or tablet every 
8-12 hours. May be adjusted to j 
individual requirements. 
Children: From 1-5 years: U2 tea- [ 
spoonful every 12 hours. Over 
5 years: 1 teaspoonful every 
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Side Effects: May include mild 
constipation, nausea, facial 
pruritus, or drowsiness, which 
disappear with adjustment of 
dose or discontinuance of 
treatment.
Overdosage: Immediately 
evacuate the stomach. Respira­
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stimulants. Convulsions, some­
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controlled by intravenous 
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barbiturates.
How Supplied: Tussionex 
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Bottles of 50. Tussionex Suspen­
sion, neutral in taste, golden 
color; 16 oz. and 900 ml. bottles. 
Tussionex Tablets, light brown, 
scored; bottles of 100. A pre­
scription for 2 oz. of the Suspen­
sion, or 12 Tablets or Capsules, 
constitutes a 6-day supply in the 
average case.
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ADVERSE REACTIONS: The following local 
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topical corticosteroids: burning, itching, 
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occur more frequently with occlusive 
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and miliaria. Contact sensitivity to a 
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PRECAUTIONS).

For full prescribing information, consult 
package insert.
HOW SUPPLIED: The 0.025% and 0.1 % 
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Marsh is very cautious in generaliz­
ing to other practices in the United 
Kingdom, and we should be even 
more cautious in generalizing to 
practices in the United States.

Marshall Eaton, MD 
University o f Washington 

Seattle

Ultrasonography in Obstetrics and 
Gynecology. Roger C. Sanders and
A. Everette James, Jr., Appleton- 
Century-Crofts, New York, 1977, 
425 pp., $26.50

Concise, clear, and practical is a 
good description for Ultrasono­
graphy in Obstetrics and Gynecol­
ogy. Edited by Dr. Roger Sanders, 
Associate Professor of Radiology 
at Johns Hopkins Medical Institu­
tions, and Dr. Everette James, Jr., 
Professor of Radiology at Vander­
bilt University School of Medicine, 
this classic publication contains in­
formation by a number of contrib­
utors from throughout the United 
States and other countries. These 
learned people represent a variety 
of specialties including obstetrics- 
gynecology, radiology, pediatrics, 
and the basic science areas of 
anatomy and reproductive biology.

The justification for such a com­
prehensive analysis of this subject 
area is clearly delineated, in that, 
ultrasound is noninvasive, causes 
no harm to the fetus, and is used 
with increasing frequency and ac­
curacy in the field of obstetrics- 
gynecology. In reviewing the chap­
ters, the outlined objectives of this 
text are more than fulfilled in all 
areas. These objectives include:
1. The relationship of physical 
principles to biologic hazards.
2. The correlation between diag­
nostic images and embryonic de­
velopment.
3. The comparison of this mo­

dality with other diagnostic studi
4. The presentation of a difftii 
tial diagnosis through its applia 
and use in the various areas of 
specialty.
5. The presentation of new infj 
mation on the technical advancê 
ultrasonography.

The writing is clear and con; 
with good and appropriate ilH 
tions, tables, and pictures, and:; 
ever-helpful section and paragt 
headings afford easy refer# 
The book is practical, frank,; 
realistic and uses case illustrali1 
when appropriate.

The book’s content note 
covers historical and fundarre 
principles of ultrasonograph) 
also reviews every possible clii 
application (normal vs abnorir: 
pregnancy grouped according 
trimester. A recipe approad 
presented to obstetrical procedi 
such as amniocentesis. Inaddi: 
alternative clinical approad® 
offered to problems in gynecol 
such as fibromyoma, ovarianr 
ses, and pelvic inflammatory 
ease. There is a fascinating ck 
on the management of intrant 
devices and the value of 
trasonography in this area.

This book is directed at 
physician involved in obsteir 
gynecology, whether a fat 
physician, obstetrician, » 
radiologist. It will also makeas 
reference for residents in if  

specialties and provide some 
ited use for medical students, 
highly recommended for its spec 
subject area to community k 
tals, medical libraries, pri' 
clinics, and undergraduate 
graduate medical education 
grams.

W ill ia m  Jacott, 
D ulu th  ft 

P rac tice  W 
D u lu th ,  Mini®

THE JOURNAL OF FAMILY PRACTICE, VOL. 6, N0.2,




